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From: Mandi Karp <mandikarp@gmail.com>

To: Ana Marrufo <Ana.Marrufo@tucsonaz.gov>

Date: 8/3/2019 2:46 PM

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL]Re: Disclaimer Language

Cc: Suzanne Mesich <Suzanne.Mesich@tucsonaz.gov>

Deposited another one today:

$3,000] 7/31/2019‘

8/3/2019} 61 E Columbus Ave Ste. 200

Phoenix AZ 85012 x

UPFF Tempe
Chapter PAC
On Aug 2, 2019, at 7:08 PM, Mandi Karp <mandikarp < ¢ymail.com> wrote:
Hi Ana,
Received this two checks and deposited them today. Thanks!
Chandler 61 E Columbus
Chapter PAC $3,000 7/30/2019 8/2/2019| Ave Ste 200 Phoenix AZ £
Surprise Pro
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