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Ana Marrufo - [EXTERNAL]Re: Disclaimer Language

[

From: Mandi Karp <mandikarp@gmail.com>

To: Ana Marrufo <Ana.Marrufo@tucsonaz.gov>

Date: 7/16/2019 11:37 AM

Subject: [EXTERNAL]Re: Disclaimer Language

Cc: Suzanne Mesich <Suzanne.Mesich@tucsonaz.gov>

Hi Ana,

Just wanted to bump this email. Also, my understanding is that I am supposed to tell you guys
anytime I receive a contribution of $1000 or more? I deposited the following yesterday:

$1000 Albert Efron Revocable Trust, _ Tucson AZ 85755—

Retired.
Is there anything else you need from me on this?

Mandi

On Jul 8, 2019, at 2:33 PM, Mandi Karp <mandikarp/@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Ana,
Hope you had a fantastic holiday! Wanted to check in with you regarding disclaimer
language. Just confirming, anyone who gives $10,000 or more must be listed on the

disclaimer? Thus, our disclaimer should read:

Paid for and Authorized by Tucson Together, X, and X (X would be any other
individual or organization who contributed the $10,000)

And does it need to be in a box in a certain font? Thanks!

Mandi
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